
Etching-Tattoo- Management 

Chromebooks w/etching MODEL Chrome books Screen print License Shipping TOTAL 

600 600 600 
Virtucom Lenovo N22 80SFOOOOUS $ 143.00 $ 6.00 $ 24.00 $ - $ 103,800.00 
Virtucom Lenovo 11e 20GF0001US $ 235.00 $ 6.00 $ 24.00 $ - $ 159,000.00 

Howard No Bid 

Troxell Asus C202 C202SA YS01 $ 176.00 $ 11.00 $ 23.75 $ - $ 126,450.00 

Best Buy for Business Asus C202 YS01 $ 168.88 $ 12.49 $ 24.50 $ 921.68 $ 124,443.68 

Best Buy for Business Asus C202 YS02 $ 178.25 $ 12.49 $ 24.50 $ 921.68 $ 130,065.68 

School Outfitters $ -
Prosys HP CB11 G4 $ 145.00 $ 8.50 $ 24.50 $ - $ 106,800.00 

Prosys HB CB11 G4 EE $ 165.00 $ 8.50 $ 24.50 $ - $ 118,800.00 

Dell Chromebook 11 $ 168.99 $ 21.00 $ 24.00 $ - $ 128,394.00 

Global Gov Ed Lenovo N22 80SFOOOOUS $ 168.00 $ 7.50 $ 24.00 $ - $ 119,700.00 

STS HPCB11G4 $ 167.00 $ 4.00 $ 28.00 $ 750.00 $ 120,150.00 

Arey Jones AcerC740 $ 213.98 $ 7.00 $ 23.50 $ - $ 146,688.00 

Arey Jones HP CB11 G4 $ 138.01 $ 7.00 $ 23.50 $ - $ 101,106.00 

Arey Jones Lenovo N22 80SFOOOOUS $ 152.79 $ 7.00 $ 23.50 $ - $ 109,974.00 
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Management 
All-in-One Chrome MODEL Chrome All-in-One License Shipping TOTAL 

32 32 
Virtucom Acer DC221HQ $ 275.00 $ 24.00 $ - $ 9,568.00 
Howard No Bid 
Troxell LG 22CV241B $ 305.01 $ 23.75 $ - $ 10,520.32 

Best Buy for Business LG 22CV241B $ 292.39 $ 24.50 $ 350.00 $ 10,490.48 
School Outfitters No Bid 

Prosys Acer CB 24 DQ.ZOEAA.001 $ 405.00 $ 24.50 $ - $ 13,744.00 
Prosys LG Chromebase 22CB25S-B $ 305.00 $ 24.50 $ - $ 10,544.00 
Dell No Bid 

Global Gov Ed LG 22CV241 $ 292.00 $ 24.00 $ - $ 10,112.00 
STS Acer DC UM.WD1AA.B01 $ 308.00 $ 28.00 $ 250.00 $ 11,002.00 
Arey Jones Acer DC UM.WD1AA.B01 $ 271.79 $ 23.50 $ - $ 9,449.28 
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Max Case 1110 Cases Case Cost Shipping TOTAL Note 

430 

Virtu com $ 11,180.00 $ - $ 11,180.00 
Howard No Bid 

Troxell $ 6,987.50 $ - $ 6,987.50 

Best Buy for Business $ 8,587.10 $ - $ 8,587.10 

School Outfitters No Bid 

Prosys $ 6,923.00 $ - $ 6,923.00 

Dell No Bid 

Global Gov Ed $ 7,417.50 $ - $ 7,417.50 
STS $ 8,600.00 $ 150.00 $ 8,750.00 Vendor Total=$9600.00 

Arey Jones $ 5,800.70 $ - $ 5,800.70 
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Accessories Accessories 

Vendor 600 Logitech M100 Shipping Total Mice 600 Califone 3066AVT Shipping TOTAL Headsets Cost per add 10-pack headsets 

Virtu com $ 4,800.00 $ - $ 4,800.00 $ 1S,OOO.OO $ - $ 15,000.00 No Bid 

Howard $ - $ 11,910.00 $ - $ 11,910.00 $ 194.00 
Troxell $ 4,638.00 $ - $ 4,638.00 $ 10,800.00 $ - $ 10,800.00 $ 178.71 

Best Buy for Business $ 4,194.00 $ 185.95 $ 4,379.95 No Bid No Bid 

School Outfitters $ - $ 11,400.00 $ - $ 11,400.00 $ 190.00 
Prosys $ 3,246.00 $ - $ 3,246.00 $ 13,458.00 $ - $ 13,458.00 $ 224.30 
Dell $ 4,560.00 $ - $ 4,560.00 No Bid No Bid 

Global Gov Ed $ 3,462.00 $ - $ 3,462.00 $ 10,500.00 $ - $ 10,500.00 $ 175.00 
STS $ 7,800.00 $ 150.00 $ 7,950.00 $ 15,000.00 $ 150.00 $ 15,150.00 $ 250.00 

Arey Jones $ 4,158.00 $ - $ 4,158.00 $ 13,770.00 $ - $ 13,770.00 $ 219.86 

STS submitted totals that were different from calculated totals: $16000.00 for the headsets and $8800.00 for the mice. 
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Aver Intelligent Charging Carts 

Vendor DES Carts HES Carts WES Carts 

4 5 7 

Virtu com 

Howard $ 4,960.00 $ 6,200.00 $ 8,680.00 

Troxell $ 4,616.00 $ 5,770.00 $ 8,078.00 

Best Buy for Business 

School Outfitters 

Prosys $' 5,740.00 $ 7,175.00 $ 10,045.00 

Dell $ 5,586.96 $ 6,983.70 $ 9,777.18 

Global Gov Ed $ 5,562.00 $ 6,940.00 $ 9,696.00 

STS $ 6,716.00 $ 8,295.00 $ 11,453.00 

Arey Jones $ 5,031.48 $ 6,289.35 $ 8,805.09 
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Notes 

LPE Carts PGE Carts LHS Carts Total 

1 2 5 
No Bid 

$ 1,240.00 $ 2,480.00 $ 5,875.00 $ 29,435.00 C36i $1175.00, C30i $1240.00 

$ 1,154.00 $ 2,308.00 $ 5,698.95 $ 27,624.95 C36i $1139.79, C30i $1154.00 

No Bid 

No Bid 

Also priced a Bretford cart at $1100 each; 

$ 1,435.00 $ 2,870.00 $ 7,625.00 $ 34,890.00 RFP specified no substitutes 

$ 1,396.74 $ 2,793.48 $ 7,699.60 $ 34,237.66 C36i $1539.92, C30i $1396.74 

$ 1,428.00 $ 2,806.00 $ 7,725.20 $ 34,157.20 C36i $1485.04; C30i $1428.00 w/shipping 

$ 1,779.00 $ 3,358.00 $ 8,745.00 $ 40,346.00 C36i $1669.00; C30i $1579 +shipping 

$ 1,257.87 $ 2,515.74 $ 6,694.25 $ 30,593.78 C36i $1338.85; C30i $1257.87 
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