

Conventional Chromebooks								
Vendor	Manufacturer	Model	Part Number	Chromebook	Google License	Freight	Total for 1940	Notes
Best Buy	Lenovo	100E	81ER0002US	\$190.99	\$23.21		\$415,548.00	
Eastern Data	Lenovo	100E	81ER0002US	\$188.06	\$23.50		\$410,426.40	
CDWG	Acer	C732	NX.GUKAA.001	\$218.00	\$24.00	\$510.48	\$469,990.48	\$510.48 charge to palletize 1940+35 Chromebooks
Dell	Dell	5190	210-AOCC	\$194.00	\$118.21		\$605,687.40	
Howard Technology	HP	CB 11 G6 EE	3NU58UT#ABA	\$225.00	\$25.00		\$485,000.00	
Troxell	HP	CB 11 G6	3NU58UT	\$213.00	\$23.23		\$458,286.20	Need to confirm if EE
Logista	HP	CB 11 G6 EE	3NU58UT	\$209.50	\$23.25		\$451,535.00	
Arey Jones	HP	CB 11 G6 EE	3NU58UT	\$201.95	\$23.23		\$436,849.20	
Arey Jones	Acer	CB 11 C732-C6WU	NX.GUKAA.001	\$258.10	\$23.23		\$545,780.20	
Arey Jones	Dell	5190 Education	TDFVJ	\$274.77	\$23.23		\$578,120.00	
Arey Jones	Lenovo	100E	81ER0002US	\$183.72	\$23.23		\$401,483.00	

Bid Opening Conducted by

Attending

Rhea Jenkins - Arey Jones

Scott Forthe

Jeff Harrell

Blake Tucker

Chris Venditti

Jason Allbritton

John Sexton

Budi Wisk 5-3-18

Brandi Wisenbaker

Finance Coordinator

Sheila Badley 5-3-18

Sheila Badley

Technology Specialist

Al Rowell 5-3-18

Al Rowell

Technology Director

Convertible Chromebooks with world-facing camera								
Vendor	Manufacturer	Model	Part Number	Chromebook	Google License	Freight	Total for 35	Notes
Best Buy	Lenovo	500E	81ES0007US	\$296.57	\$23.21		\$11,192.30	
Eastern Data	Lenovo	500E	81ES0007US	\$291.47	\$23.50		\$11,023.95	
CDWG	Acer	R751TN	NX.GNJAA.002	\$345.00	\$24.00		\$12,915.00	Freight included with conventional
CDWG	Acer	R751T	NX.GPZAA.001	\$300.00	\$24.00		\$11,340.00	Freight included with conventional
Dell	Dell	5190 2-N-1	210-AOCQ	\$289.00	\$118.21		\$14,252.35	
Howard Technology	HP	CB X360 W/DIG	2DR10UT#ABA	\$356.00	\$25.00		\$13,335.00	
Howard Technology	HP	CB X360 WO/DIG	2DQ88UT#ABA	\$313.00	\$25.00		\$11,830.00	
Troxell	HP	CB X360 N3350	2DQ88UT	\$295.00	\$23.23		\$11,138.05	
Logista	HP	CB X360 W/DIG	2DR10UT#ABA	\$329.50	\$23.25		\$12,346.25	
Logista	HP	CB X360 WO/DIG	2DQ88UT#ABA	\$289.50	\$23.25		\$10,946.25	
Arey Jones	HP	CB X360 W/DIG	2DR10UT#ABA	\$317.77	\$23.23		\$11,935.00	
Arey Jones	HP	CB X360 WO/DIG	2DQ88UT#ABA	\$279.22	\$23.23		\$10,585.75	
Arey Jones	Acer	R751TN-C5P3	NX.GNJAA.002	\$368.90	\$23.23		\$13,724.55	
Arey Jones	Dell	5190 2-N-1	FK9M0	\$354.80	\$23.23		\$13,231.05	
Arey Jones	Lenovo	500E-81ES	81ES0007US	\$285.45	\$23.23		\$10,803.80	

Bid Opening Conducted by

Attending
 Rhea Jenkins - Arey Jones
 Scott Forthe
 Jeff Harrell
 Blake Tucker
 Chris Venditti
 Jason Allbritton
 John Sexton

Budi Wise 5-3-18

Brandi Wisenbaker
 Finance Coordinator

Sheila Badley 5-3-18
 Sheila Badley
 Technology Specialist

Al Rowell 5-3-18

Al Rowell
 Technology Director

Aver C36i+ Carts						
Vendor	10 Delivered to HMS	11 Delivered to LMS	9 Delivered to PGM	15 Delivered to LHS	TOTAL	Notes
Best Buy						No bid
Eastern Data						no bid
CDWG	\$15,000.00	\$16,300.00	\$13,200.00	\$22,500.00	\$67,000.00	
Dell	\$12,990.00	\$14,289.00	\$11,691.00	\$19,485.00	\$58,455.00	
Howard Technology	\$12,000.00	\$13,200.00	\$10,800.00	\$18,000.00	\$54,000.00	
Troxell	\$11,600.00	\$12,760.00	\$10,440.00	\$17,400.00	\$52,200.00	
Logista	\$14,000.00	\$15,400.00	\$12,600.00	\$21,000.00	\$63,000.00	
Arey Jones	\$11,910.00	\$13,101.00	\$10,719.00	\$17,865.00	\$53,595.00	
Bid Opening Conducted by				Attending		
				Rhea Jenkins - Arey Jones		
				Scott Forthe		
<u>Budi Wisn 5-3-18</u>				Jeff Harrell		
Brandi Wisenbaker				Blake Tucker		
Finance Coordinator				Chris Venditti		
				Jason Allbritton		
				John Sexton		
<u>Sheila Badley 5-3-18</u>						
Sheila Badley						
Technology Specialist						
<u>Al Rowell 5-3-18</u>						
Al Rowell						
Technology Director						

Accessories						
Vendor	Proposed Case 1	2250 Delivered	Proposed Case 2	2250 Delivered	Proposed Headset 1	1000 Delivered
Best Buy	Max Case MCZSGEN11BLK	\$34,875.00	Kensington K62609WW	\$25,875.00	Art Craft AC-6008	\$10,250.00
SunRise HiTek	RLB63-11-ALS-K	\$60,750.00				
Eastern Data	Max Case MCZSGEN11BLK	\$33,750.00			AC-6008	\$9,000.00
CDWG	Max Case MCZSGEN11BLK	\$39,375.00			AC-6008	\$9,500.00
Dell	no bid				no bid	
Howard Technok	Max Case MCZSGEN11BLK	\$38,250.00			AC-6008	\$10,320.00
Troxell	Max Case MCZSGEN11BLK	\$36,450.00			AC-6008	\$9,250.00
Logista	Max Case MCZSGEN11BLK	\$34,470.00			AC-6008	\$8,950.00
Arey Jones	Max Case MCZSGEN11BLK	\$36,855.00			AC-6008	\$8,650.00
Bid Opening Conducted by				Attending		
				Rhea Jenkins - Arey Jones		
				Scott Forthe		
				Jeff Harrell		
				Blake Tucker		
				Chris Venditti		
				Jason Allbritton		
				John Sexton		
<p><u>Budi Wison 5-3-18</u></p> <p>Brandi Wisenbaker Finance Coordinator</p>						
<p><u>Sheila Badley 5-3-18</u></p> <p>Sheila Badley Technology Specialist</p>						
<p><u>Al Rowell 5-3-18</u></p> <p>Al Rowell Technology Director</p>						